
NORTH LONDONDERRY TOWNSHIP
TAB SHEET

 2025 SANITARY SEWER LINE CLEANING TELEVISING
Bid Opening - March 6, 2025 - 10:15 a.m.

EST. FT. PER FOOT TOTAL

  Arold Construction Cleaning 14,844 4.00 59,376.00
       51 Powder Mill Bridge Road Televising 14,844 4.00 59,376.00
       Kingston, NY 12401

Total 118,752.00

  Ditchcreek Utility Services, Inc. Cleaning 14,844 1.60 23,750.40
       820 East Lincoln Avenue Televising 14,844 0.71 10,539.24
       Myerstown, PA 17067

Total 34,289.64

  Duke's Root Control, Inc. Cleaning 14,844
       400 Airport Road, Suite E Televising 14,844
       Elgin, IL 60123

Total NO BID

  Insight Pipe Contractors Cleaning 14,844 0.74 10,984.56
       232 East Lancaster Road Televising 14,844 1.00 14,844.00
       Harmony, PA 16037

Total 25,828.56

  Insituform Sales Cleaning 14,844
       3014 US Highway 301 N, Suite 700 Televising 14,844
       Tampa, FL 33619

Total NO BID

  Jet Services, Inc. Cleaning 14,844 1.65 24,492.60
       306 Red Oak Court Televising 14,844 0.20 2,968.80
       Mars, PA 16046

Total 27,461.40
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  Metra Industries Cleaning 14,844
       50 Muller Place Televising 14,844
       Little Falls, NJ 07424

Total NO BID

  Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe Inc. Cleaning 14,844 2.60 38,594.40
       1566 Harding Highway Televising 14,844 2.60 38,594.40
       Newfield, NJ 08344

Total 77,188.80

  Mr. Rehab Inc. Cleaning 14,844 1.33 19,742.52
       3 Long Lane Televising 14,844 1.33 19,742.52
       Mechanicsburg, PA 17050

Total 39,485.04

  Pipe Data View Services Cleaning 14,844 0.70 10,390.80
       9 Railroad Avenue Televising 14,844 0.55 8,164.20
       Christiana, PA 17509

Total 18,555.00

  Pipe Services Corporation Cleaning 14,844 0.55 8,164.20
       665 Tower Lane Televising 14,844 0.55 8,164.20
       West Chester, PA 19380

Total 16,328.40

  Sewer Specialty Services Co., Inc. Cleaning 14,844 0.93 13,804.92
       2462 New Road Televising 14,844 0.93 13,804.92
       Leicester, NY 14481

Total 27,609.84

BID CORRECTION - Based on Per Foot $$
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  Utility Services Group Inc. Cleaning 14,844 1.50 22,266.00
       1304 Slate Hill Road Televising 14,844 1.30 19,297.20
       Camp Hill, PA 17011

Total 41,563.20

  Your Quality Solutions, Inc. Cleaning 14,844
       24 Cobblestone Drive Televising 14,844
       Willow Street, PA 17584

Total NO BID
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